ADAIR COUNTY COMMISSION MINUTES MONDAY, JUNE 22, 2015

Continued from page 79

The Commission spent the rest of the day attending to County business.

The Adair County Commission adjourned at 4:00 p.m. on June 22, 2015.

IN REF. ORDER NO 17 2015 Bids for Tubes, Grader Blades and Concrete

		BID SHEET		
			227	
	Adai	r County Concre		
Item	Item Description	Quantity	Unit Price	Amount
1	Concrete/Delivery	Per Yard	#112.00	\$112.004
2	Test Cylinder	ea.	\$ 3.00	\$ 300 e
3				
4				
	TOTAL BID		\$115.00	
WE H Part The b	ER ACHNOWLEDGES: IEREBY SUBMIT FOR YOUR CONSIDER 1: <u>5000 P5f wfd R plss 7</u> (Amounts to be shown in bidder agrees that this bid shall be go the scheduled dosing time for receible, bidder will execute a formal cont	dest cylindes oth words and figure ood and may not be ving bids. Upon reco	es. State NO BID if app withdrawn for a period eipt of written notice o	licable) I of 60 calendar da
WE H Part The l after this l	IEREBY SUBMIT FOR YOUR CONSIDE 1: <u>50co P5f wfd R plss.</u> (Amounts to be shown in biolider agrees that this bid shall be go the scheduled closing time for receivid, bidder will execute a formal contectfully submitted:	dest cylindes oth words and figure ood and may not be ving bids. Upon reco	es. State NO BID if app withdrawn for a period eipt of written notice o	licable) I of 60 calendar da
WE H Part The b after this b Resp	ISEBY SUBMIT FOR YOUR CONSIDE: 15.500 PSt QUILD. Puss Amounts to be shown in biolder agrees that this bid shall be got the scheduled closing time for receil, dibidder will execute a formal contectfully submitted: (Company Name) (Name of Blodder's Representative)	dest cylindes oth words and figure ood and may not be ving bids. Upon rec- tract upon receipt w destance of the color destance of t	s. State NO BID if app withdrawn for a perioc eigt of written notice o ithin 10 days.	licable) of 60 calendar da f the acceptance o
WE H Part The b after this b Resp	ISEBY SUBMIT FOR YOUR CONSIDE! 15 500 PSF dJiR Puls. (Amounts to be shown in bi sidder agrees that this bid shall be go the scheduled closing time for recei- dib. bidder will execute a format contectfully submittee: KUSOLUBL Rea (Company Name) (Name of Bidder's Representative ess: 40.2 W Matth	dest cylinder oth worlds and figure sod and may not be wing bids. Upon reci tract upon receipt w dy Mix dy Mix e) b b b complete the Road	es. State NO BID if app withdrawn for a period eight of written notice of ithin 10 days. **Huk Auch** **Huk Auch	of 60 calendar da f the acceptance of
WE H Part The I after this I Resp	ISBERY SUBMIT FOR YOUR CONSIDE: "5000 PSF QUILD. Puss Amounts to be shown in biolider agrees that this bid shall be got the scheduled closing time for received, bidder will execute a formal contextfully submitted: (Company Name) (Name of Bidders' Representation (Name of Bidders' Representation (Name of Bidders' Representation (Name of Bidders' Representation	dest cylinder oth worlds and figure sod and may not be wing bids. Upon reci tract upon receipt w dy Mix dy Mix e) b b b complete the Road	es. State NO BID if app withdrawn for a period eight of written notice of ithin 10 days. **Huk Auch** **Huk Auch	licable) t of 60 calendar da f the acceptance o

		Sedalia, MO. 653 6-8570 Fax 660-826-8575			
dair County C					
dair County Co			June 22, 2015		
o Adair Count Courthouse, 10 Kirksville, Misso	6 W.Washing	gton St.	RE: Annular Rive	ted Culverts	Bid
dair County C	ommission:				
18				nina Thie s	vine
We are pleased	to quote the	following prices for your a Riveted Culvert Pipe.	nnular riveted culvert	pipe. Tilia j	Apr.
	LOTT PATRICIA	THE COLUMN THE PARTY OF THE PAR		DE 0.	
GALVANIZED:			ALUMINIZED TY	PE 2:	
Diameter	Guage	Price per Foot	Diameter	Guage	Price per Foot
12"	16	s 8.10	12"	16	\$ 8.88
	16	9.79	15"	16	10.50
15"		12.22	18"	16	13.36
18"	16	18.99	24"	14	19.79
24"	14		30"	14	24.34
30"	14	23.76		14	29.41
36"	14	28.51	36"		52.52
48"	12	48.99	48"	12	
60"	12	61.29	60"	12	65.30
60"	10	75.99	60"	10	82.66
72"	10	109.42	72*	10	100.01
96"	10	145.41	96*	10	131.99
72"	8	119.45	72"	8	N/A
96"	8	163.03	96"	8	N/A
NOTE: NOTE: TERMS: DELIVERY:	Minimum 0 Net 30 day	inds Same as 1.5' of Pipe, ect any questions regarding Order is \$3,500.00 Or a Dri s. unty Yard, Kirksville, Misso	this quote to Randy op Charge will Apply.	as 2" of Pipe Dillon.	•
We would like	to thank you	for the opportunity to bid o	n your annular riveter	d culvert pipe	needs.
			Respectfully Sul		
			VIEBROCK SAL	ES & SERV	ICE LLC
			by B	1 1/1/11	
			1000 100	Telle	~
			Randy Dillon, Sa	iles Manage	r

Columbia, MO 65203 573-449-4427 PROPOSAL	TAL CONTRACT		1102 Sykes Street Albert Lea, MN 560 507-373-3726 340 Water Street
	dwest Sales Office		Evansville, WI 5353 608-882-5336
P.O. Box 330 State Route 97 South Jefferson	711 Heisinger Rd. City, MO 65102 Fax (573) 634-8729		706 W. 3rd Avenue Monmouth, IL 6146 309-734-4113
309-543-2271 (573) 030-7312 BID DATE: JUNE 22, 2015 @ 10:00 AM	Tax (5/5) 654-5/25		000 101 1110
ADAIR COUNTY COMMISSION			
C/O ADAIR COUNTY CLERK 106 W. WASHINGTON KIRKSVILLE, MO 63501			
JOB & LOCATION: 2015 ANNULAR RIVETS KIRKSVILLE, ADAIR (ED CULVERT BID COUNTY, MISSOURI		
PLAIN GALVANIZED	R RIVETED CORRUGATED METAL PIPE '2" CORRUGATION		
12" DIAM 16 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ \$	6.94/LF 8.74/LF
15" DIAM 16 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ \$ @ \$	10.37/LF
18" DIAM 16 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ S	17.47/LF
24" DIAM 14 GA GALVANIZED CMP		Ø S	21.45/LF
30" DIAM 14 GA GALVANIZED CMP 36" DIAM 14 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ \$	25.58/LF
48" DIAM 12 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ \$	47.89/LF
60" DIAM 12 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ \$	60.14/LF
60" DIAM 10 GA GALVANIZED CMP		0 \$	76.83/LF 91.73/LF
72" DIAM 10 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ \$ @ \$	113.10/LF
72" DIAM 8 GA GALVANIZED CMP		0 5	122.31/LF
96" DIAM 10 GA GALVANIZED CMP 96" DIAM 8 GA GALVANIZED CMP		@ \$	150.70/LF
THIS QUOTE IS GENERAL TO ACCEPTANCE MITHIN 30 INCIDENTS IS LABEL, AND TO ALL OF THE TREMS AN ARE A PART HEREOF. METAL CULTURETS HICK RESERVE THREE TREMS ARE NOT ACCEPTED AS STATED. THIS IS OUR BEST METHATE OF QUANTITIES AND MY LETTING. TERMS: NET 10 DAYS (BASED ON APPROVED OF TAXISS: DOES NOT INCLUDE ANY STATE OR LABELTURE OF ALL OF TAXISS: DOES NOT MINCLUDE ANY STATE OR LABELTURE AND ANY ANY ANY AND ANY	O CONDITIONS ON THE REVER S THE RIGHT TO ESCALATE P TERIALS, CONTRACTOR TO VE CREDIT)	RICES OR	WITHDRAWAL IF
	.5' OF PIPE		
12" WIDE SAME AS 1			
12" WIDE SAME AS 1 24" WIDE SAME AS 2 (ADAIR.162215)			
24 " WIDE SAME AS 2 [ADAIR.162215] Date sceepted		ULVERTS,	INC.
24 WIDE SAME AS 2 [ADAIR,162215] Date scepped subject to and including all of said terms and conditions on the reverse side. Final acceptance an approval of price terms and others is reserved to Corporate Office.	ByB	ULVERTS,	
[ADJIR.162215] Date accepted subject to and feel-slice as species of price forms and others is reserved to Corporate Office. Buyer Subject to and feel-slice as the service slice. Final acceptions as approval of price forms and others is reserved to Corporate Office. Buyer	ByBales F	Cours	
[ADMIR.167215] 24* WIDE SAME AS 2 [ADMIR.167215] Date accepted whosper of the forms and conditions on the reverse 16st. Final acceptance and appropried of price terms and others is recovered in Computer State. Buye Authorized By.	By Bales Feb. (Office)	Cours	
[ADJIR.162215] Date accepted subject to and feel-slice as species of price forms and others is reserved to Corporate Office. Buyer Subject to and feel-slice as the service slice. Final acceptions as approval of price forms and others is reserved to Corporate Office. Buyer	By Sales Rep) (Office) (Office)	Representative	

109 Dakota Street Columbia, MO 65203 573-449-4427 PROS	OSAL CUIT	AL	CONTRACT		1102 Sykes Street Albert Lea, MN 56007 507-373-3726
504 Wilson Industrial Drive Maryville, MO 64468 680-582-4962	Corporate/Min	west Sales Of	fice		340 Water Street Evansville, WI 53536 608-882-5336
	P.O. Box 330	711 Heisinge	r Rd.		
State Route 97 South Havana, IL 62644 309-543-2271	Jefferson (573) 636-7312	City, MO 65102 Fax (573) 634			706 W. 3rd Avenue Monmouth, IL 61462 309-734-4113
BID DATE: JUNE 22, 2015 9 1	0:00 AM				
ADAIR COUNTY COMMISSION C/O ADAIR COUNTY CLERK 106 W. WASHINGTON KIRKSVILLE, MO 63501					
	NNULAR RIVETE				
ALUMIN	ANNULANIZED TYPE II 2 2/3" x 1/3				
12" DIAM 16 GA ALUMINIZED CH				@ \$	7.30/LF
15" DIAM 16 GA ALUMINIZED C				@ \$	9.18/LF 10.91/LF
18" DIAM 16 GA ALUMINIZED CH 24" DIAM 14 GA ALUMINIZED CH				0 \$	18.14/LF
30" DIAM 14 GA ALUMINIZED CH				@ 5	22.28/LF
36" DIAM 14 GA ALUMINIZED CH	1P			@ \$	26.57/LF
48" DIAM 12 GA ALUMINIZED CH	1P			@ \$	49.43/LF
60" DIAM 12 GA ALUMINIZED CH	IP.			@ \$	62.07/LF
60" DIAM 10 GA ALUMINIZED CY 72" DIAM 10 GA ALUMINIZED CY	IP			0 \$	79.29/LF 94.67/LF
72" DIAM 8 GA ALUMINIZED CO	IP IP			0 5	N/A
96" DIAM 10 GA ALUMINIZED CH	IP.			0 5	126.23/LF
96" DIAM 8 GA ALUMINIZED CH	1P			@ \$	N/A
THIS QUOTE IS SUBJECT TO ACCEPT. MINICIPERE IS LATER, AND TO ACADE. A ABER A PART HERSOF. METAL CULVER THISS TERMS ARE NOT ACCEPTED AS THIS IS OUR BEST ESTIMATE OF QUA LETTING. TERMS: NET 30 DAYS (BASED TAXES: DOES NOT INCLUDE ANY TAXES: DOES NOT INCLUDE ANY CONNECTING BANDS: 7"	F THE TERMS AND TS INC RESERVES STATED. NTITIES AND MATE ON APPROVED CF. STATE OR LOC	CONDITIONS OF THE RIGHT TO SERIALS, CONTRIBUTEDIT) CAL TAXES I KIRKSVILL	N THE REVERSE ESCALATE PRIC	SIDE OF	F THIS QUOTE WHICH WITHDRAWAL IF
CONNECTING BANDS: 7" WI	DE SAME AS 1.				
	DE SAME AS 2'	OF PIPE			
{ADAIR.062215}					
Date accepted subject of said terms and conditions on the reverse side approval of price terms and others is reserved to	o Corporate Office.	ву	METAL CULV	w	
Authorized By	Buyer	Phone (Sales Re	np)		
Phone		(Office) _ Final Authorizati	00		
Requested Delivery Date		r insi Authorizati	Director	of Sales, f	Metal Culverts, Inc.
*TERMS: Standard Price Terms are Net 30 U.					

Continued on page 81

ATTEST

County Clerk

ndra (vllop) Tankel Fleben lerk Presiding Commissioner

Page 80